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KIWOCLEAN DEGREASER 1:50 concentrate 

1. DESCRIPTION 
 
KIWOCLEAN DEGREASER 1:50 concentrate is a low foaming highly 
concentrated cleaning and degreasing solution. Its low foaming 
makes it especially suitable for use in automatic reclaiming 
machinery. It is suitable for all mesh types and prevents pinholes and 
irregularities in coating. KIWOCLEAN DEGREASER 1:50 
concentrate emulsifies dirt and grease making them water soluble.  
 
2. APPLICATION 
 
KIWOCLEAN DEGREASER 1:50 concentrate can be diluted with 
water at a ratio of 1:50 (1 part degreaser concentrate to 50 parts 
water). Follow machine manufacturer’s directions. Tests should be 
carried out using the actual machine, as metering ratios vary. Set a 
thorough rinsing cycle after applying the degreaser solution. 
 
It is recommended to degrease the screens as shortly before the 
screen is coated as possible, to eliminate contamination of the clean 
screen.  
 
KIWOCLEAN DEGREASER 1:50 concentrate can also be used for a 
degreasing cycle prior to de-coating or reclaiming to remove oily 
residues from solvents and inks.  
 
3. PHYSICAL DATA 
 
Color:   Clear 
 
Consistency:  Liquid 
 
Shelf Life:   2 years at 68 degrees Fahrenheit 
   (20 degrees Celsius) 
 
Flash Point:  Not applicable 
 
TLV:   Not applicable 
 
VOC:   None 
 
pH value:   9   
 
HMIS rating:  Health - 1 
   Flammability - 0 
   Reactivity – 0 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
4. PERSONAL PROTECTION 
 
It is recommended to wear protective glasses and gloves. See Safety 
Data Sheet for additional information. 
 
 
5. ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
 
KIWOCLEAN DEGREASER 1:50 concentrate solutions can be 
eliminated through biological decomposition in adapted waste water 
treatment plants. The working solution can generally be emptied into 
the drains. Consult local authorities for local regulations. 
 
6. PACKAGING 
 
1 US quart, 1 US gallon, 5 US gallon containers 
 
 
7. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION  
 
For additional product information, please visit our web site at 
www.kiwo.com. All products mentioned in this Technical Information 
are available through KIWO Inc. and its distributor network. For 
further information contact your authorized KIWO distributor or KIWO 
directly.  
 
Thank you for choosing KIWO. 
 
 


